ROAD COMMISSION OF MACOMB COUNTY
Bid Opening of November 10, 2010

One (1) Year's Requirement of Liquid Calcium Chloride and Brine

Bid #10-23

38%Chloride Delivered

Delivered to Storage Applied
Washington Shelby Twp. Washington Clinton Twp. | Shelby Twp.
Twp. S.C. (per New Haven Clinton Twp. S.C. (per Twp. S.C. (per New Haven S.C. (per S.C. (per
VENDORS ton) S.C. (per ton) | S.C. (per ton) ton) ton) S.C. (per ton) ton) ton)
Great Lakes Chloride, Inc. 0.52 0.52 0.52 N/A 0.565 0.565 N/A 0.565
Road Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid
Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid
Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales 0.548 0.548 0.548 N/A 0.568 0.568 N/A 0.568
Mid Thumb Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid




ROAD COMMISSION OF MACOMB COUNTY
Bid Opening of November 10, 2010
One (1) Year's Requirement of Liquid Calcium Chloride and Brine

Bid #10-23

30%Chloride Delivered

Delivered to Storage Applied
Washington Shelby Twp. Washington Clinton Twp. | Shelby Twp.
Twp. S.C. (per New Haven | Clinton Twp. | S.C. (per Twp. S.C. (per New Haven S.C. (per S.C. (per
VENDORS ton) S.C. (per ton) | S.C. (per ton) ton) ton) S.C. (per ton) ton) ton)
Great Lakes Chloride, Inc. 0.425 0.425 0.425] N/A 0.47 0.47] N/A 0.47
Road Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid
Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid
Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales 0.478 0.478 0.478 N/A 0.498 0.498 N/A 0.498
Mid Thumb Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid




ROAD COMMISSION OF MACOMB COUNTY
Bid Opening of November 10, 2010

One (1) Year's Requirement of Liquid Calcium Chloride and Brine

Bid #10-23
Brine
Delivered to Storage Applied
Washington Shelby Twp. Washington Clinton Twp. | Shelby Twp.
Twp. S.C. (per New Haven | Clinton Twp. | S.C. (per Twp. S.C. (per New Haven S.C. (per S.C. (per
VENDORS ton) S.C. (per ton) | S.C. (per ton) ton) ton) S.C. (per ton) ton) ton)
Great Lakes Chloride, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid
Road Maintenance 0.11 0.11 0.11 N/A 0.122 0.122 N/A 0.122
Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC 0.1141 0.1141 0.1141 N/A 0.1141 0.1141 N/A 0.1141
Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales 0.22 0.22 0.22 N/A 0.24 0.24 N/A 0.24
Mid Thumb Materials 0.105 0.105 0.105 N/A 0.12 0.12 N/A 0.13




