Macomb County Department of Roads

One (1) Year's Requirements of Tires and Recapping
Bid # 11-10
May 11, 2011
Effective June 1, 2011 unitl May 31, 2012

Passenger
Radial Tires| P235/70R17 |P225/50R17| 235/55R17 225/60R/16 |P235/75R17
VENDOR All Season All Season All Season All Season | All Season
Inventory #'s 1431075
Usage for One
year 0
105.47/Goodyear
115.99/Goodyear Assurance Fuel 99.45/Goodyear 69.43/Goodyear |100.86/Goodyear
Smiley Wrangler SR-A Max Assurance Fuel Max Eagle GT Wrangler SR-A
Trader Ray
Prices only 74.50/Goodyear | 73.00/Goodyear
ood til 10-19- 103.00/Goodyear Eagle RSA i
g 114.00/Goodyear 91.00/Goodyear | pojice 260aA;97.00 Eagle 6T | Eagle RSA Police | Wrangler SRA
2011 Wrangler SRA 500/AB| Eagle GT 400/AA non-Police 400/AA 260/AA 500/AB
100.90/Firestone 70.20/Firestone
Jam Best No Bid No Bid Firehawk G Pursuit FR710 No Bid
115.99/Goodyear | 147.92/Goodyear 99.45/Goodyear 67.52/Goodyear |100.86/Goodyear
Leslie Tire Wrangler SRA Eagle RSA Assurance Integrity Wrangler SRA
117.71/Goodyear
125.00/Firestone 83.51/Firestone 77.33/Firestone Wrangler Silent
Belle Tire Destination A/T FR710 87.13/Firestone FR710 FR710 Arnor
Dependable No Bid




Macomb County Department of Roads

One (1) Year's Requirements of Tires and Recapping
Bid # 11-10
May 11, 2011
Effective June 1, 2011 unitl May 31, 2012

Light Truck P255/70 P245/70
Tires LT225/75 R16 |{P235/75 R16| LT235/85 R16 [LT245/75 R16 R16 R17
VENDOR All Season All Season All Season All Season All Season | All Season

Inventory #'s 1431090 1431082 1431105
Usage for One
year 18 32 29
131.72/Goodyear|
107.52/Goodyear 97.49/Goodyear 108.44/Goodyear 113.74/Goodyear | 97.22/Goodyear | Wrangler Silent
Smiley Wrangler H/T Wrangler SR-A Wrangler SR-A Wrangler H/T Wrangler SR-A Armor
Trader Ray
Prices onIy 79.99/Goodyear
; Wrangler RTS
good til 10-19-|  106.00/Goodyear | 97.00/Goodyear |  108.00/Goodyear | 114.00/Goodyear |ss0/ap.o7.00 Wrangier| 119.00 Wrangler
2011 Wrangler SRA Wrangler SRA Wrangler SRA Wrangler SRA SRA 500/AB SRA 500/AB
9460/Firestone 9198/Firestone 9836/Firestone 9455/Firestone 9659/Firestone | 95.30/Firestone
Jam Best Transforce HT Destination LE Transforce Ht Transforce HT Destination LE | Destination AT
97.93
107.52/Goodyear | Goodyear/Wrang| 119.63/Goodyear 114.47/Goodyear | 79.99/Goodyear |101.87/Goodyear
Leslie Tire Wrangler H/T er ST Wrangler HT Wrangler SRA Wrangler RTS | Wrangler SRA
90.79/Firestone 92.50/Firestone 100.36/Firestone 96.55/Firestone 97.57/Firestone | 97.30/Firestone
Belle Tire Transforce HT Desination LE Transforce HT Transforce HT Destination LE | Destination A/T

Dependable

No Bid




Macomb County Department of Roads

One (1) Year's Requirements of Tires and Recapping

Bid #11-10
May 11, 2011
Effective June 1, 2011 unitl May 31, 2012

Truck Tires 265/75 R22.5 225/70 R19.5 10.00X20 11 R22.5 11 R22.5 315/80 R22.5(315/80 R22.5 |315/80 R22.5
VENDOR Tubeless Tubeless Tube Tubeless Tubeless Tubeless [Tubeless Tubeless
Inventory #'s 1431250 1431238 1431235 1431235 1431243
Usage for One
year 34 16 102 102 12
389.50/Goodyear|537.52/Goodyear|524.38/Goodyear]
266.89/Gooyear 214.77/Goodyear 315.75/Goodyear 350.74/Goodyear | G670 756-141- G287 DS 756- G289 DS 756-
Smiley G149 756-305-184| G670 139-418-050 N/A (G282 138-307-668 G138-179-337 050 141-245 141-614
Trader Ray 264.00/Goodyear G622 | 55 18/Goodyear | 326.00/Goodyear |537.00/Goodyear
Prices only good RSD MRT Reg o 399.00/Dunlop SP345;
y g Drive;:280.00 G661 HAS- G622 RSD-DFIVG, 1000R20 G177 333.00/Goodyear 350.00/Goodyear 479.00/Goodyear G287 MSA 524.00/G289
til 10-19-2011 All Pos. 235.68 RSS-All Pos. LRH G182 RSD G661 HAS G287MSA DuraSeal WHA DuraSeal
L — 535.00/Goodyear|522.00/Goodyear
FS560255/7T0R2225 is 29900/Firestone T819;| 283.10/Firestone |333.03/Firestone 9287MSA 9289WHA
Jam Best equal to 255/80 R22.5** No Bid No Bid 31200 T831 FS560 Plus T819 Duraseal Duraseal
537.52/Goodyear|524.38/Goodyea
280.00/Goodyear 220.00/Akuret Hi-|  312.50/Goodyear 349.00/Goodyear | 431.11/Dunlop [G287 MSA G289WHA
Leslie Tire 661HSA 232.00/Goodyear 647 Lug G282 16ply 661 HAS 16ply SP381 Duraseal Duraseal
301.75/Bridgestone| 222.31/Firestone FS | 330.98/Firestone 292.36/Firestone | 361.27/Firestone|537.52/Goodyear|524.38/Goodyear]
Belle Tire R250 560Plus T831 327.73/Firestone T831 FS560PIus T819 G287 Duraseal | G289 Duraseal
Dependable No Bid




Macomb County Department of Roads

One (1) Year's Requirements of Tires and Recapping
Bid # 11-10
May 11, 2011
Effective June 1, 2011 unitl May 31, 2012

Off Road
Tires 12.4 x 24 18.4 x 30 11.2 x 24 16.9 x 30 17.5 xR25
VENDOR Tube Tube Tube Tube Tubeless
Inventory #'s 1431270
Usage for One
year 6
Smiley Treadura Lug R1 TR135R1Lug TreaduraLugR1 TR135R1Lug N/A
Trader Ray
Prices only
good til 10-19- | 372 00/Carlisle Farm |637.00/Titan High| 234.00/ Carlisle Farm | 553.00/Titan High
2011 Specialists 8 ply Power Lug R-1 Specialists Traction N/A
109000/Brideston
e
656.06/Firestone VSTEUKTRACTI
Jam Best No Bid Super All Traction No Bid No Bid ON
413.00/Titan Hi Trac | 618.00/Titan Hi | 298.00/Titan Hi Trac [549.00/Titan Hi Trac| 1150.00/Titan
Leslie Tire Lug Trac Lug Lug Lug MXL
597.23/Firestone 639.23/Firestone 492.24/Firestone | 1456.58/Bridgest
Traction Field and | Super All Traction 270.23/Firestone Super All Traction one Vsteel K
Belle Tire Road 1123 Super All Traction 1123 1123 Traction
Dependable No Bid




Macomb County Department of Roads
One (1) Year's Requirements of Tires and Recapping
Bid # 11-10
May 11, 2011
Effective June 1, 2011 unitl May 31, 2012

Tires for
Recapping 11 R22.5 17.5 X R25
VENDOR Radial Radial
Inventory #'s 1431236
Usage for
One year 134
Smiley 148.00/ 1 Week N/A
Trader Ray
Prices only
good til 10-19
2011 N/A N/A
Jam Best No Bid No Bid
Leslie Tire 117.95/2-3 Days 849.95/2 Weeks
Belle Tire 118.74/4 Days 460.00/2-3 Weeks
Dependable 139.00/ 4 Days




One (1) Year's Requirements of Tires and Recapping

Macomb County Department of Roads

Bid #11-10
May 11, 2011

Effective June 1, 2011 unitl May 31, 2012

Medium

Casing Credit| Truck Small Off Large Off

VENDOR Radial Road Radial | Road Radial
Smiley $50.00 $20.00 $30.00
Trader Ray
Prices only good
til 10-19-2011 N/A N/A N/A
Jam Best
Leslie Tire $60.00 $50.00 $150.00
Belle Tire $50.00 $25.00 $100.00
Dependable $75.00 $50.00 $125.00
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