Macomb County Department of Roads
One (1) Year's Requirments of Traffic Sign Delineator Posts Release Delivery as Required, July 1, 2011--June 30, 2012
Bid #11-17
Bid Opening June 22, 2011

Dornbos Vulcan Carrier & Gable Rathco MD Solutions
3.00# Sign Post
10’ Galvanized $20.83 $24.00 NO BID $20.65 $22.25
12’ Galvanized $24.99 $28.80 NO BID $24.78 $26.41
14’ Galvanized $29.16 $33.60 NO BID $28.91 $31.06
16’ Galvanized $33.33 $38.40 NO BID $33.04 $35.21

12 Gauge Unistrut Type Material with Holes All 4 Holes Sides spaced 1” on Centers Full Length — Galvanized

1-1/4” 37.05 NO BID $28.60 $35.60 NO BID
1-1/2” $35.23 NO BID $28.70 $33.87 NO BID
1-3/4” $41.02 NO BID $33.45 $39.44 NO BID

2 $44.79 NO BID $36.35 $43.06 NO BID




