Macomb County Department of Roads
ITB 11-19

Safety Barricades and Cones

Bid Opening: Wednesday June 22, 2011

Description

Qty

UoOM

Rathco

Applied
Industrial

Choctaw-
Kaul

RG Plastics

State
Barricades

Safety
Zone

Florida
Transcor

Contractors
Connection

Lightle
Enterprises

Plastic 8' Type Il
Barricade High
Intensity Prismatic
Sheeting Double
Sided 1"x8"x96"

22

Ea

$199.25

NO BID

$222.00

$171.86

$199.95

$167.70

$202.32

$235.10

$207.00

Plastic Drum w/4"
Engineer Grade
Reflective Stripe--
Type Il Barricades
"Rubber Rings
Included”

200

Ea

$36.85

$30.25

$33.85

$31.45

$29.17

$46.50

$32.82

$41.60

$32.99

28" Orange Traffic
Cone with "MCDR"
Permanently
Stenciled
vertically(3"
Lettering) on cone
and 10# Base.

315

Ea

$13.98

$20.80

$12.25

$12.15

$18.05

$11.15

$11.75

$10.70

$12.99

42" Orange Grabber
Cone with 10# Base.
Must have 4"
reflective collar

25

Ea

$32.50

$24.40

$21.15

$27.95

$26.73

$28.70

$20.23

$26.20

$20.65

45"x25"Plastic Type
1 with 12"x24" Stiped
Oo/W

30

Ea

NO BID

$41.45

$44.66

$64.94

$57.73

$69.80

$65.10

$69.40

$40.30

LED Road Flare 6-
pack kit with Yellow
LED's

Ea

NO BID

$527.95

$147.20

$250.00

$561.70

NO BID

$577.29

$144.00

NO BID

Total Price

$16,969.70

$16,567.30

$17,970.10

$17,546.02

$20,565.60

$19,313.15

$19,484.20

$20,175.70

$16,969.10




