Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-21

One (1) Year's Requirements of Limestone--Various State Specifications Release and Delivery as Required, August 1, 2011-July 31, 2012
July 20, 2011

23A MODIFIED LIMESTONE

Delivery Locations

Washington Twp. S.C. (perfNew Haven S.C. (per| Clinton Twp S.C. (per Shelby Twp S.C.
VENDORS ton) ton) ton) (per ton)
Vogelsberg $11.75 $11.35 $11.00 $11.35
Manchik $11.75 $11.25 $10.50 $11.75
Gary's $12.70 $11.50] $11.70 $12.20||
Detroit Bulk $12.47 $11.42 $12.78| $12.78|
Osburn $13.95 $13.65] $13.65 $13.65
Messina $13.00 $13.00 $12.50 $12.65
Levy no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"




Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-21

One (1) Year's Requirements of Limestone--Various State Specifications Release and Delivery as Required, August 1, 2011-July 31, 2012
July 20, 2011

6A LIMESTONE

Delivery Locations

Washington Twp. S.C. (perfNew Haven S.C. (per| Clinton Twp S.C. (per Shelby Twp S.C.
VENDORS ton) ton) ton) (per ton)
Vogelsberg $13.00 $12.60 $12.25 $12.60
Manchik $12.35 $12.00] $11.25 $12.00||
Gary's no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"
Detroit Bulk no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"
Osburn $16.00 $16.00 $15.60 $15.60||
Messina $13.75 $13.75 $13.25 $13.40|
Levy $20.37 $20.16) $18.73| $19.45




Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-21

One (1) Year's Requirements of Limestone--Various State Specifications Release and Delivery as Required, August 1, 2011-July 31, 2012

July 20, 2011

1/4" CHIP LIMESTONE

Delivery Locations

Washington Twp. S.C. (perfNew Haven S.C. (per| Clinton Twp S.C. (per Shelby Twp S.C.
VENDORS ton) ton) ton) (per ton)
Vogelsberg $15.50 $15.50 $15.00 $15.00
Manchik no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"
Gary's no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"
Detroit Bulk no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"
Osburn no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"
Messina no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"
Levy no bid] no bid no bid] no bid"




Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-21

One (1) Year's Requirements of Limestone--Various State Specifications Release and Delivery as Required, August 1, 2011-July 31, 2012
July 20, 2011

23A MODIFIED LIMESTONE

On site Deliveries (Spreading) in Townships within the Service Center Location

Townships

VENDORS BRUCE | WASHINGTON RAY ARMADA | RICHMOND| LENOX | CHESTERFIELD| CLINTON | HARRISON] SHELBY | MACOMB
Vogelsberg $14.25 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.55 $13.55 $13.55 $13.55 $13.55 $13.75 $13.7
Manchik $12.90 $12.90 $12.90 $12.90 $12.40 $12.40 $12.40 $12.50 $12.50 $12.55 $12.55
Gary's no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid
Detroit Bulk $13.12 $13.12 $13.12 $13.12 $12.32 $12.32 $12.32 $12.77 $12.77 $12.77 $12.77
Osburn $14.25 $14.25 $14.25 $14.25 $14.15 $14.15 $14.15 $14.25 $14.25 $14.15 $14.15
Messina $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $12.50 $12.50 $12.65 $12.65
Levy no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid




