Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-22

One (1) Year's Requirements of 23A Road Gravel Release and Delivery as Required, August 1, 2011-July 31, 2012
July 20, 2011

23A STATE SPEC. GRAVEL

Delivery Locations

Washington Twp. S.C. (per | New Haven S.C. (per | Clinton Twp S.C. (per | Shelby Twp S.C. (per
VENDORS ton) ton) ton) ton)
BJ Forrest $9.55 $10.15 $10.35 $9.85
Manchik $8.20 $9.25 $11.15 $8.30|
Eisenhardt $8.00 $9.90, $12.00 $8.35
Osburn $10.95 $12.20 $12.15 $11.00|
Messina $10.65 $10.95 $10.95 $10.75
23A STATE SPEC. GRAVEL
On site Deliveries (Spreading) in Townships within the Service Center Location
Townships
VENDORS BRUCE | WASHINGTON RAY ARMADA | RICHMOND| LENOX | CHESTERFIELD| CLINTON | HARRISON| SHELBY | MACOMB

BJ Forrest $10.05 $10.05 $10.05 $10.05 $10.80 $10.80 $10.80 $11.30 $11.30 $10.30 $10.30
Manchik $9.50 $9.50 $9.50 $9.50 $10.25 $10.25 $10.25 $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $10.79
Eisenhardt no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid] no bid no bid
Osburn $11.15 $11.15 $12.00 $12.00 $12.45 $12.45 $11.65 $11.45 $11.95 $11.15 $11.45
Messina $10.65 $10.65 $10.65 $10.65 $10.95 $10.95 $10.95 $10.95 $10.95 $10.75 $10.79




