Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-23

One (1) Year's Requirements of Crushed Concrete Release and Delivery as Required, August 1, 2011-July 31, 2012

July 20, 2011

21AA Crushed Concrete

Delivery Locations

VENDOR Washington Twp. S.C.(perton) | New Haven S.C.(perton) | Clinton Twp. S.C.(perton) | Shelby Twp. S.C.(per ton)
Manchik $8.25 $8.25 $6.75 $8.00
Clancy $8.65 $6.75 $6.48 $6.94
Gary's $10.00 $7.50 no bid no bid
Osburn $9.40 $9.40 $8.90 $9.40
J&H $7.50 no bid $7.25 $7.40
Messina $9.20 $9.20 $8.55 $8.75
Fiore $7.14 $6.83 $6.53 $6.83
Ajax* $9.50 $9.25 $8.75 $9.75

*during frost law months, an additional $6 p/ton will be added




Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-23

One (1) Year's Requirements of Crushed Concrete Release and Delivery as Required, August 1, 2011-July 31, 2012

July 20, 2011

321 Crushed Concrete

Delivery Locations

VENDOR Washington Twp. S.C.(perton) | New Haven S.C.(perton) | Clinton Twp. S.C.(perton) | Shelby Twp. S.C.(per ton)
Manchik no bid no bid no bid no bid
Clancy $9.19 $8.29 $7.15 $9.19
Gary's $11.50 $8.75 no bid no bid
Osburn no bid no bid no bid no bid
J&H no bid no bid no bid no bid
Messina $10.20 $10.20 $9.55 $9.75
Fiore $9.13 $8.33 $7.33 $9.13
Ajax no bid no bid no bid no bid




