
Macomb County Department of Roads

ITB 11-28

Safety Barricades and Cones

Opening Date: August 24, 2011

Description Qty UOM

State 

Barricade Work Area Rathco Osburn

Choctaw 

Kaul RG Plastics

Give Em A 

Brake Safety Zone

Contractors 

Connection

Plastic 8' Type III 

Barricade High 

Intensity Prismatic 

Sheeting Double 

Sided 1"x8"x96" 25 Ea 199.95 No Bid $151.80 $165.00 $182.00 $171.86 $171.84 $182.20 $177.85

Plastic Drum w/4" 

Engineer Grade 

Reflective Stripe--

Type II Barricades 

"Rubber Rings 

Included" 520 Ea $39.50 $53.95 $41.39 $42.30 $43.00 $56.69 $43.20 $60.45 $48.25

28" Orange Traffic 

Cone with "MCDR" 

Permanently 

Stenciled 

vertically(3" 

Lettering) on cone 

and 10# Base.  315 Ea $11.60

$14.45          

(w/collar)       

$10.49        

(w/o collar) $13.83 $10.60 $12.43 $12.15 $12.96 $11.85 $11.60

42" Orange Grabber 

Cone with 10# Base.  

Must have 4" 

reflective collar 45 Ea $24.50 $19.02 $24.20 $26.40 $17.90 $29.95 $26.34 $34.00 $28.35

45"x25"Plastic Type 

1 with 12"x24" Stiped 

O/W 30 Ea $43.00 No Bid $42.90 $46.50 $37.85 $64.97 $48.36 $71.60 $50.25

LED Road Flare 6-

pack kit with Yellow 

LED's 4 Ea $545.47 No Bid $239.00 $195.00 $128.00 $250.00 $540.00 No Bid $595.00

Total Price  $33,767.13

$32,214.25                   

$33,461.65 $33,006.25 $32,823.00 $37,282.80 $41,899.40 $35,638.50 $43,399.75 $38,353.50
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