Macomb County Department of Roads
ITB 12-07
Cutting Edges for Snowplows
Opening Date: December 7, 2011

Description Lacal St. Regis Truck and Trailer Valk Winter
Cutting Edge for Henderson Plow
5/8" x 8" x 10' $163.33 No Bid $119.62 $119.00 $144.20
Cutting Edge for Henderson Plow
5/8" x 8" x 12' $196.00 No Bid $143.55 $142.99 $173.04
Cutting Edge for Wausau Plow
1/2" x 6" x 12' $133.00 No Bid $85.40 $85.00 No Bid
Cutting Edge for Monroe Wing Plow
5/8" x 8" x 9' $146.99 No Bid $129.45 $107.00 $129.78
Estimated Time of Delivery ARO 20 days No Bid 30-45 days 7-14 days 5-6 weeks
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