
Macomb County Department of Roads
RFP 11-08

Furnish, Maintain and Service Dumpsters
Opening Date:  October 6, 2011

Description Waste Equipment
Waste 

Management Sterling Republic Metro

Trash Removal No Bid 300.00$                 275.00$                 365.00$                 247.00$                 

Tire Removal No Bid 690.00$                 575.00$                 675.00$                 691.00$                 

Trash Removal No Bid 300.00$                 275.00$                 365.00$                 247.00$                 

Tire Removal No Bid 690.00$                 575.00$                 675.00$                 691.00$                 

Trash Removal No Bid 300.00$                 275.00$                 365.00$                 247.00$                 

Tire Removal No Bid 690.00$                 575.00$                 675.00$                 691.00$                 

Trash Removal No Bid 300.00$                 275.00$                 365.00$                 247.00$                 

Tire Removal No Bid 690.00$                 575.00$                 675.00$                 691.00$                 

Trash Removal No Bid 75.00$                   65.00$                   30.00$                   90.00$                   
Monthy Monthly

New Haven Service Center

Washington Twp. Service Center

New Haven Service Center

Clinton Twp. Service Center

Shelby Twp. Service Center
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