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Plastic 8' Type III Barricade 

High Intensity Prismatic 

Sheeting Double Sided 

1"x8"x96" 22 Ea No Bid $4,461.60 No Bid $4,898.96 $4,383.50 $5,958.26 $3,780.92 $4,398.90 $5,172.20

Plastic Drum w/4" 

Engineer Grade Reflective 

Stripe--Type II Barricades 

"Rubber Rings Included" 200 Ea No Bid $5,070.00 $5,290.00 $6,494.00 $7,370.00 $6,344.00 $6,290.00 $5,726.00 $8,320.00

30" Orange Traffic Cone 

with "MCDR" Permanently 

Stenciled vertically(3" 

Lettering) on cone and 10# 

Base.  315 Ea No Bid No Bid $5,733.00 No Bid $4,403.70 $4,954.95 $3,887.10 $5,578.65 $3,370.50

42" Orange Grabber Cone 

with 10# Base.  Must have 

4" reflective collar 25 Ea No Bid $636.25 $535.00 $732.75 $812.50 No Bid $748.75 $560.25 $655.00

45"x25"Plastic Type 1 with 

12"x24" Stiped O/W 30 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,009.10 $1,624.20 $2,640.00

LED Road Flare 6-pack kit 

with Yellow LED's 4 Ea $1,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,000.00 $2,211.84 $576.00

Total Price  $1,980.00 $10,167.85 $11,558.00 $12,125.71 $16,969.70 $17,257.21 $17,715.87 $20,099.84 $20,733.70

*All Brands Acceptable*

NO AWARD - NEEDS TO BE PUT OUT FOR SEALED BID


