
Macomb County Department of Roads
Mechanics Jackets

RFQ 12-01
Deadline:  November 4, 2011

Size (Spring Coats) MacKellar
Image 

Impress. Liberty Store Broner Uniforms Mfg. Maurer's Arrow
Excellent 

Police
Contractor's 

Clothing

Medium $24.08 $39.97 $24.27 $24.70 $25.05 $29.27 $24.71 $35.00 $29.75

Large - Regular $24.08 $39.97 $24.27 $24.70 $25.05 $29.27 $24.71 $35.00 $29.75

Large - Long/Tall $24.08 $39.97 $24.27 $24.70 $25.05 $29.27 $29.68 $35.00 $35.67

2X Large - Regular $28.90 $47.97 $28.12 $29.65 $30.06 $35.12 $29.68 $39.00 $35.67

2X Large Long $28.90 $47.97 $28.12 $29.65 $30.06 $35.12 $29.68 $39.00 $35.67

3X Large $28.90 $47.97 $28.12 $29.65 $30.06 $35.12 $29.68 $39.00 $35.67

5X Large - Long/Tall $60.21 $47.97 $53.17 $61.75 $62.62 $73.17 $72.27 No Bid $57.40

Size (Winter Coats)

Medium No Bid No Bid $44.80 $51.28 $52.00 $48.60 $56.00 $54.95 $58.00

Large - Regular No Bid No Bid $44.80 $51.28 $52.00 $48.60 $56.00 $54.95 $58.00

Large - Long/Tall No Bid No Bid $48.80 $56.41 $57.20 $48.60 $61.60 $54.95 $63.80

2X Large - Regular No Bid No Bid $44.80 $51.28 $52.00 $50.12 $56.00 $58.95 $58.00

2X Large Long No Bid No Bid $48.80 $56.41 $57.20 $50.12 $61.60 $58.95 $63.80

3X Large No Bid No Bid $48.80 $56.41 $57.20 $53.15 $61.60 $58.95 $63.80

5X Large - Long/Tall No Bid No Bid $52.80 $62.05 $62.40 $57.71 $61.60 $58.95 $69.60

Total $219.15 $311.79 $543.94 $609.92 $617.95 $623.24 $654.81 $622.65 $694.58
*Bids are "as read" at the November 4th opening.
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